BID TABULATION
37-20 "MILK, DAIRY & RELATED ITEMS"
ERICKA ANDREW, BUYER

| BORDEN DAIRY
EXTENDED LINE ERICEJEERIUNIT INCLUDING MILK LSS AR W Y
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION ESTIMATE USAGE QTY PRODUCT NUMBER Pm(cc’i;f_ﬁlz’)“" ITEM PRICING - c‘f;;;g"lglm COOLERS - "R‘g ;ET‘:C‘;‘"T "E‘;(,'}‘é;‘égggi‘c’?;i - c}“g‘&igcm’um Es'g'gl‘v;g‘;ggf‘v -
(CARTON) COOLERS EXTENDED PRICING COOLERS
25349 * NO PLASTIC
! WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK - 1/2 PINT 200 AVAIL $ 0.2043 | $ 40.8600 | $ 0.2193 | $ 43.8600 | $ 0.2043 | $ 40.8600 | $ 0.2193 | $ 43.8600
2 WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK - PINT 5 25095 $ 0.6500 | $ 3.2500 | $ 0.6500 | $ 3.2500 | $ 0.6500 | $ 3.2500 | $ 0.6500 | $ 3.2500
WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK — QUART 5 25089 $ 0.8500 | $ 4.2500 | $ 0.8500 | $ 4.2500 | $ 0.8500 | $ 4.2500 | $ 0.8500 | $ 4.2500
4 WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK — 1/2 1.000
GALLON ’ 25083 $ 1.5000 | $ 1,500.0000 | $ 1.5000 | $ 1,500.0000 | $ 1.5000 | $ 1,500.0000 | $ 1.5000 | $ 1,500.0000
5 WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK - GALLON 2,000 25077 $ 2.9000 | $ 5,800.0000 | $ 2.9000 | $ 5,800.0000 | $ 2.9000 | $ 5,800.0000 | $ 2.9000 | $ 5,800.0000
6 SKIM MILK — % PINT 300,000 25352/25400 $ 0.1860 | $ 55,800.0000 | $ 0.2010 | $ 60,300.0000 | $ 0.2110 | $ 63,300.0000 | $ 0.2260 | $  67,800.0000
7 SKIM MILK, VANILLA — % PINT 200,000 25371 $ 0.2100 | $ 42,000.0000 | $ 0.2250 | $ 45,000.0000 | $ 0.2100 | $ 42,000.0000 | $ 0.2250 | $  45,000.0000
8 WHOLE STRAWBERRY MILK, - 1 PINT 5 25101 $ 0.6500 | $ 3.2500 | $ 0.6500 | $ 3.2500 | $ 0.6500 | $ 3.2500 | $ 0.6500 | $ 3.2500
9 SKIM MILK, STRAWBERRY - 1/2 PINT 400,000 25373/25374 $ 0.2040 | $ 81,600.0000 | $ 0.2190 | $ 87,600.0000 | $ 0.2290 | $ 91,600.0000 | $ 0.2440 | $  97,600.0000
10 1 % LOW FAT MILK - 1/2 PINT 2,000,000 25351/25399 $ 0.1880 | $  376,000.0000 | $ 0.2030 | $  406,000.0000 | $ 0.2130 | $  426,000.0000 | $ 0.2280 | $ 456,000.0000
11 1% LOW FAT MILK — QUART 5 25091 $ 0.7500 | $ 3.7500 | $ 0.7500 | $ 3.7500 | $ 0.7500 | $ 3.7500 | $ 0.7500 | $ 3.7500
12 1% LOW FAT MILK — % GALLON 5 25085 $ 1.3500 | $ 6.7500 | $ 1.3500 | $ 6.7500 | $ 1.3500 | $ 6.7500 | $ 1.3500 | $ 6.7500
13 1% LOW FAT MILK — GALLON 50 25079 $ 2.5000 | $ 125.0000 | $ 2.5000 | $ 125.0000 | $ 2.5000 | $ 125.0000 | $ 2.5000 | $ 125.0000
14 2% LOW FAT MILK — QUART 5 25090 $ 0.8000 | $ 4.0000 | $ 0.8000 | $ 4.0000 | $ 0.8000 | $ 4.0000 | $ 0.8000 | $ 4.0000
15 2% LOW FAT MILK - % GALLON 200 25084 $ 1.4500 | $ 290.0000 | $ 1.4500 | $ 290.0000 | $ 1.4500 | $ 290.0000 | $ 1.4500 | $ 290.0000
16 2% LOW FAT MILK — GALLON 50 25078 $ 2.6000 | $ 130.0000 | $ 2.6000 | $ 130.0000 | $ 2.6000 | $ 130.0000 | $ 2.6000 | $ 130.0000
17 WHOLE BUTTERMILK - 1/2 GALLON 10,000 15559 $ 1.9500 | $ 19,500.0000 | $ 1.9500 | $ 19,500.0000 | $ 1.9500 | $ 19,500.0000 | $ 1.9500 | $  19,500.0000
18 SKIM — HALF GALLON 50 25086 $ 1.2900 | $ 64.5000 | $ 1.2900 | $ 64.5000 | $ 1.2900 | $ 64.5000 | $ 1.2900 | $ 64.5000
19 SKIM - GALLON 5 25080 $ 2.4000 | $ 12.0000 | $ 2.4000 | $ 12.0000 | $ 2.4000 | $ 12.0000 | $ 2.4000 | $ 12.0000
20 NON-FAT BUTTERMILK - 1/2 PINT 5 25861 * 1% FAT [ $ 0.2200 | $ 1.1000 | $ 0.2350 | $ 1.1750 | $ 0.2200 | $ 1.1000 | $ 0.2350 | $ 1.1750
21 NON-FAT BUTTERMILK - QUART 5 12174 *1% FAT | $ 1.8000 | $ 9.0000 | $ 1.8000 | $ 9.0000 | $ 1.8000 | $ 9.0000 | $ 1.8000 | $ 9.0000
22 NON-FAT BUTTERMILK - 1/2 GALLON 5 290 $ 1.4700 | $ 7.3500 | $ 1.4700 | $ 7.3500 | $ 1.4700 | $ 7.3500 | $ 1.4700 | $ 7.3500
23 NON-FAT BUTTERMILK — GALLON 5 12167 $ 3.4500 | $ 17.2500 | $ 3.4500 | $ 17.2500 | $ 3.4500 | $ 17.2500 | $ 3.4500 | $ 17.2500
24 LACTOSE (LACTAID) FREE MILK - % PINT 1,000 16570 * NO PLASTIC| $ 0.6440 | $ 644.0000 | $ 0.6590 | $ 659.0000 | $ 0.6440 | $ 644.0000 | $ 0.6590 | $ 659.0000
25 LACTOSE FREE MILK - QUART 5 4292 * Half-Gal | $ 3.9000 | $ 19.5000 | $ 3.9000 | $ 19.5000 | $ 3.9000 | $ 19.5000 | $ 3.9000 | $ 19.5000
26 SOUR CREAM - 16 OZ 1,750 22135 $ 1.2400 | $ 2,170.0000 | $ 1.2400 | $ 2,170.0000 | $ 1.2400 | $ 2,170.0000 | $ 1.2400 | $ 2,170.0000
27 SOUR CREAM - 5 LB 7,000 21945 $ 7.1500 | $ 50,050.0000 | $ 7.1500 | $ 50,050.0000 | $ 7.1500 | $ 50,050.0000 | $ 7.1500 | $  50,050.0000
28 WHIPPING CREAM - % PINT 25 25621 $ 0.8000 | $ 20.0000 | $ 0.8000 | $ 20.0000 | $ 0.8000 | $ 20.0000 | $ 0.8000 | $ 20.0000
29 WHIPPING CREAM - QTS 25 25638 $ 2.3000 | $ 57.5000 | $ 2.3000 | $ 57.5000 | $ 2.3000 | $ 57.5000 | $ 2.3000 | $ 57.5000
30 HALF & HALF - QTS 100 25626 $ 1.6500 | $ 165.0000 | $ 1.6500 | $ 165.0000 | $ 1.6500 | $ 165.0000 | $ 1.6500 | $ 165.0000
31 HALF & HALF (400 COUNT) 50 404 $ 12.3000 | $ 615.0000 | $ 12.3000 | $ 615.0000 | $ 12.3000 | $ 615.0000 | $ 12.3000 | $ 615.0000
32 COTTAGE CHEESE, REDUCED FAT - 24 0Z 50 25496/16.0z $ 1.5700 | $ 78.5000 | $ 1.5700 | $ 78.5000 | $ 1.5700 | $ 78.5000 | $ 1.5700 | $ 78.5000
33 COTTAGE CHEESE, REDUCED FAT -5 LB 900 25152 $ 7.8000 | $ 7,020.0000 | $ 7.8000 | $ 7,020.0000 | $ 7.8000 | $ 7,020.0000 | $ 7.8000 | $ 7,020.0000
34 FRESH ORANGE JUICE, 4 OZ 350,000 25390 $ 0.1200 | $ 42,000.0000 | $ 0.1200 | $ 42,000.0000 | $ 0.1200 | $ 42,000.0000 | $ 0.1200 | $  42,000.0000
35 FRESH ORANGE JUICE, 8 OZ 5 25384 $ 0.1940 | $ 0.9700 | $ 0.1940 | $ 0.9700 | $ 0.1940 | $ 0.9700 | $ 0.1940 | $ 0.9700
36 FRESH ORANGE JUICE, 16 OZ 5 12211 $ 0.3800 | $ 1.9000 | $ 0.3800 | $ 1.9000 | $ 0.3800 | $ 1.9000 | $ 0.3800 | $ 1.9000
37 FRESH ORANGE JUICE, 64 OZ 5 25391 $ 1.1500 | $ 5.7500 | $ 1.1500 | $ 5.7500 | $ 1.1500 | $ 5.7500 | $ 1.1500 | $ 5.7500
38 SKIM MILK, CHOCOLATE — 1/2 PINT 50,000 25369/25370 $ 0.1987 | $ 9,935.0000 | $ 0.2137 | $ 10,685.0000 | $ 0.2237 | $ 11,185.0000 | $ 0.2387 | $  11,935.0000
39 CHOCOLATE WHOLE - HALF GALLON 38,000 25087 $ 1.6500 | $ 62,700.0000 | $ 1.6500 | $ 62,700.0000 | $ 1.6500 | $ 62,700.0000 | $ 1.6500 | $  62,700.0000
40 1% MILK, CHOCOLATE — 1/2 PINT 2,000,000 25396/25354 $ 0.2017 | $  403,400.0000 | $ 0.2167 | $  433,400.0000 | $ 0.2267 | $  453,400.0000 | $ 0.2417 | $ 483,400.0000
41 1 % MILK, CHOCOLATE - GALLON 80,000 25082 $ 3.2300 | $  258,400.0000 | $ 3.2300 | $  258,400.0000 | $ 3.2300 | $  258,400.0000 | $ 3.2300 | $ 258,400.0000
42 NON-DAIRY CREAMER - BOX (400 COUNT) 100 512 $ 10.3300 | $ 1,033.0000 | $ 10.3300 | $ 1,033.0000 | $ 10.3300 | $ 1,033.0000 | $ 10.3300 | $ 1,033.0000
GRAND TOTAL| § 86.3807 | $ 1,421,238.4300 | $ 86.5157 | $ 1,495,506.5050 | $ 86.5057 | $ 1,539,988.4300 | $ 86.6407 | $ 1,614,256.5050




MINIMUM ORDER PER DELIVERY (IF APPLICABLE)

BORDEN DAIRY

NONE

PACA REGIONS TO SERVE|

ALL REGIONS COVERED

MAXIMUM COMPLETION OR DELIVERY TIME: _ DAYS FROM RECEIPT OF ORDER OOR NOTICE TO PROCEED

3

AMENDMENTS 1 THROUGH 7

YES

SIGNATURE PAGE

YES

EXPERIENCE STATEMENT]

YES

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT

YES

EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY CERTIFICATION FORM

YES

CERTIFICATION REGARDING DEBARMENT, SUSPENSION CONVICTIONS, PLEAS AND OTHER RESPONSIBLE MATTERS

YES

NOTIFICATION OF INTENT TO RESPOND

YES

AFFIDAVIT OF CONTRACTOR ALABAMA ACT 2011-535

YES

VENDOR CONTACT INFORMATION

YES

PACA REQUIREMENTS

YES

EXCEPTIONS

LINE ITEM: 1 NO PLASTIC AVAILABLE; LINE ITEMS: 20 & 21 ARE 1% INSTEAD OF NON-FAT BUTTERMILK; LINE
ITEM: 25 IS HALF-GALLON SIZE; LINE ITEM: 32 IS 16 OZ, INSTEAD OF 24 OZ.

GUARANTEE POLICY

BORDEN DAIRY GUARANTEES AND WARRANTS ALL PRODUCTS DELIVERED TO MEET THE STANDARDS SET
BY THE SPECIFICATIONS OUTLINED UNDER THIS CONTRACT. IF SUCH PRODUCTS ARE NOT UP TO
STANDARD, THEY WILL BE REPLACED AT NO CHARGE WITHIN 24 HOURS OF THE DETERMINATION OF
UNACCEPTABILITY.

CONTINGENCY PLAN

CURRENTLY, WE ARE STAFFED IN MULTIPLE LOCATIONS WITH PERSONAL TO COVER BREAKDOWNS OR ANY
OTHER ISSUES OUR DRIVERS ENCOUNTER. OUR FLEET SERVICE COMPANY WORKS DILIGENTLY TO
PREVENT ROADSIDE BREAKDOWNS; HOWEVER, IN THE EVENT WE HAVE A BREAKDOWN A MEMBER OF
MANAGEMENT IS IMMEDIATELY IDSPATCHED TO SERVE OUR CUSTOMERS. AT ANY POINT WE HAVE
DELAYED DELIVEREIES ALL CUSTOMERS ARE CONTACTED. *FLEET IS CONTACTED TO DETERMINE THE
EXTENT OF DOWNTIME INVOLVED. **CUSTOMER IS NOTIFIED OF DELAYED DELIVERIES.** IN THE EVENT
REPAIRS CANNOT BE MADE IN A TIMELY MANNER A MEMBER OF MANAGEMENT IS DISPATCHED TO SERVE
CUSTOMERS IN A SPARE TRUCK.




BID TABULATION
37-20 "MILK, DAIRY & RELATED ITEMS"
ERICKA ANDREW, BUYER

BARBER'S/PRAIRIE FARMS/"EAST SIDE JERSEY DAIRY"
PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER UNIT
PRICE PER UNIT BRI LAY LIS CARTON] RHCCUDINCRII PRICE PER UNIT | NO MILK COOLERS - PLASTIC) MILK COOLERS -
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION ESTIMATE USAGE QTY PRODUCT NUMBER (CARTON) EIEMIERICING mclumme r’a]u.x COOLERSN (PLASTIC)) EXTENED PRICING mc:.unme N{ILK EXTENED PRICING
(CARTON) COOLERS EXTENDED PRICING COOLERS
1 WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK — 1/2 PINT 200 NO PRODUCT # | § 0.2389 | $ 47.7800 | $ 0.2489 | $ 49.7800 | $ 02589 | § 51.7800 | $ 0.2689 | § 53.7800
2 WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK — PINT 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 0.9500 | $ 4.7500 | $ 0.9700 | $ 4.8500 | $ 0.9500 | $ 4.7500 | $ 0.9700 | $ 4.8500
3 WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK — QUART 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 1.6800 | $ 8.4000 | $ 1.7200 | $ 8.6000 | $ 1.6800 | $ 8.4000 | $ 1.7200 | $ 8.6000
4 WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK — 1/2 GALLON 1,000 NO PRODUCT # | $ 1.9800 | $ 1,080.0000 | $ 1.9800 | $ 1,080.0000 | $ 1.9800 | $ 1,080.0000 | $ 1.9800 | § 1,980.0000
5 WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK — GALLON 2,000 NO PRODUCT # | $ 3.6798 | $ 7,359.6000 | $ 3.8398 | $ 7,679.6000 | $ 3.6798 | % 7,359.6000 | $ 3.8398 | § 7,679.6000
6 SKIM MILK - % PINT 300.000 NO PRODUCT # | $ 0.2050 | $ __ 61,500.0000 | $ 02150 | $ __ 64,500.0000 | $ 0.2299 [ 68,970.0000 | $ 02399 [ $ __ 71,970.0000
7 SKIM MILK, VANILLA - % PINT 200,000 NO PRODUCT # | $ 0.2099 | $ __ 41,980.0000 | $ 02199 | $ __ 43,980.0000 | $ 0.2299 | 45,980.0000 | $ 02399 [ $ __ 47,980.0000
s WHOLE STRAWBERRY MILK, - 1 PINT 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 0.9500 | $ 4.7500 | $ 0.9700 | $ 4.8500 | $ 0.9500 | $ 4.7500 | $ 0.9700 | $ 4.8500
9 SKIM MILK, STRAWBERRY - 1/2 PINT 400,000 NO PRODUCT # | $ 0.2099 [ $ __ 83,960.0000 | $ 02199 | $ __ 87,960.0000 | $ 0.2299 [ $ __ 91,960.0000 | $ 02399 [$ __ 95,960.0000
10 1 % LOW FAT MILK - 1/2 PINT 2,000,000 NO PRODUCT # | $ 0.2000 | $ __400,000.0000 | $ 0.2100 | $ _ 420,000.0000 | $ 0.2299 | $ _ 459,800.0000 | $ 0.2399 [ $ __ 479,800.0000
11 1% LOW FAT MILK - QUART 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 1.5500 | $ 7.7500 | $ 1.5500 | $ 7.7500 | $ 1.5500 | $ 7.7500 | $ 1.5500 | § 7.7500
12 1% LOW FAT MILK — % GALLON 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 1.8300 | $ 9.1500 | $ 1.9100 | $ 9.5500 | $ 1.8300 | $ 9.1500 | $ 1.9100 | § 9.5500
13 1% LOW FAT MILK - GALLON 50 NO PRODUCT # | $ 3.4840 | $ 174.2000 | $ 3.6440 | $ 182.2000 | $ 3.4840 | 174.2000 | $ 3.6440 | § 182.2000
14 2% LOW FAT MILK — QUART 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 1.6200 | $ 8.1000 | $ 1.6200 | $ 8.1000 | $ 1.6200 | $ 8.1000 | $ 1.6200 | § 8.1000
15 2% LOW FAT MILK — % GALLON 200 NO PRODUCT # | $ 1.8900 | $ 378.0000 | $ 1.9700 | $ 394.0000 | $ 1.8900 | $ 378.0000 | $ 1.9700 | $ 394.0000
16 2% LOW FAT MILK — GALLON 50 NO PRODUCT # | $ 3.5900 | $ 179.5000 | $ 3.7500 | $ 187.5000 | $ 3.5900 | § 179.5000 | $ 3.7500 | § 187.5000
17 WHOLE BUTTERMILK — 1/2 GALLON 10.000 NO PRODUCT # | $ 1.6888 | $ __ 16,888.0000 | $ 1.6888 | $ __ 16,888.0000 | $ 1.6888 | $ _ 16,888.0000 | $ 1.6888 | $ __ 16,888.0000
18 SKIM — HALF GALLON 50 NO PRODUCT # | $ 1.7800 | $ 89.0000 | $ 1.8600 | $ 93.0000 | $ 1.7800 | $ 89.0000 | $ 1.8600 | $ 93.0000
19 SKIM - GALLON 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 3.4100 | $ 17.0500 | $ 3.5700 | $ 17.8500 | $ 3.4100 | § 17.0500 | $ 3.5700 | § 17.8500
20 NON-FAT BUTTERMILK — 1/2 PINT 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 0.2678 | $ 1.3390 | $ 0.2778 | $ 1.3890 | $ 0.2678 | $ 1.3390 | $ 0.2778 | § 1.3890
21 NON-FAT BUTTERMILK - QUART 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 1.4000 | $ 7.0000 | $ 1.4000 | $ 7.0000 | $ 1.4000 | $ 7.0000 | $ 1.4000 | § 7.0000
22 NON-FAT BUTTERMILK — 1/2 GALLON 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 1.6888 | $ 8.4440 | $ 1.7688 | $ 8.8440 | $ 1.6888 | $ 8.4440 | $ 1.7680 | $ 8.8400
23 NON-FAT BUTTERMILK — GALLON 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 3.6798 | $ 18.3990 | $ 3.8398 | $ 19.1990 | $ 3.6798 | 18.3990 | $ 3.8398 | § 19.1990
24 LACTOSE (LACTAID) FREE MILK - % PINT 1,000 NO PRODUCT # | $ 0.6679 | $ 667.9000 | $ 0.6679 | $ 667.9000 | $ 0.6679 | $ 667.9000 | $ 0.6679 | $ 667.9000
25 LACTOSE FREE MILK — QUART 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 0.6679 | $ 3.3395 | $ 0.6679 | $ 3.3395 | $ 0.6679 | $ 3.3395 | $ 0.6679 | § 3.3395
26 SOUR CREAM — 16 0Z 1.750 NO PRODUCT # | $ 1.8340 | $ 3,209.5000 | $ 1.8540 | $ 3,244.5000 | $ 1.8340 | $ 3,209.5000 | $ 1.8540 | § 3,244.5000
27 SOUR CREAM - 5 LB 7,000 NO PRODUCT # | $ 7.6700 | $ __ 53,690.0000 | $ 83100 | $ __ 58,170.0000 | $ 7.6700 | $ __ 53,690.0000 | $ 8.3100 | $ _ 58,170.0000
28 WHIPPING CREAM — % PINT 25 NO PRODUCT # | $ 1.6832 | $ 42.0800 | $ 1.6932 | $ 42.3300 | $ 1.6839 | $ 42.0975 | $ 1.6932 | & 42.3300
29 WHIPPING CREAM - QTS 25 NO PRODUCT # | $ 5.0400 | $ 126.0000 | $ 5.0400 | $ 126.0000 | $ 5.0400 | § 126.0000 | $ 5.0400 | $ 126.0000
30 HALF & HALF - QTS 100 NO PRODUCT # | $ 2.3400 | $ 234.0000 | $ 2.3400 | $ 234.0000 | $ 2.3400 | § 234.0000 | $ 2.3400 | § 234.0000
31 HALF & HALF (400 COUNT) 50 NO PRODUCT # | $ 13.2300 | $ 661.5000 | $ 13.3900 | $ 669.5000 | $ 13.2300 | $ 661.5000 | $ 13.3900 | & 669.5000
32 COTTAGE CHEESE, REDUCED FAT - 24 0Z 50 NO PRODUCT # | $ 2.3789 | 118.9450 | $ 2.4789 | 123.9450 | $ 2.3789 | § 118.9450 | $ 2.4789 | § 123.9450
33 COTTAGE CHEESE, REDUCED FAT - 5 LB 900 NO PRODUCT # | $ 7.8500 | $ 7,065.0000 | $ 8.4900 | $ 7,641.0000 | $ 7.8500 | § 7,065.0000 | $ 8.4900 | & 7,641.0000
34 FRESH ORANGE JUICE, 4 OZ 350.000 NO PRODUCT # | $ 0.1430 | $ __ 50,050.0000 | $ 1.4800 | $ _ 518,000.0000 | $ 1.4300 | $ _ 500,500.0000 | $ 0.1480 | $ __ 51,800.0000
35 FRESH ORANGE JUICE, 8 OZ 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 0.1430 | $ 0.7150 | $ 0.1480 | $ 0.7400 | $ 0.1430 | § 0.7150 | $ 0.1480 | § 0.7400
36 FRESH ORANGE JUICE, 16 OZ 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 1.5340 | $ 7.6700 | $ 1.5540 | $ 7.7700 | $ 1.5340 | $ 7.6700 | $ 1.5540 | & 7.7700
37 FRESH ORANGE JUICE, 64 OZ 5 NO PRODUCT # | $ 2.1989 | 10.9945 | $ 2.2789 | 11.3945 | $ 2.1989 | § 10.9945 | $ 2.2789 | § 11.3945
38 SKIM MILK, CHOCOLATE — 1/2 PINT 50,000 NO PRODUCT # | $ 0.2099 | $ __ 10,495.0000 | $ 0.2199 | $ __ 10,995.0000 | $ 0.2299 [ 11,495.0000 | $ 0.2399 [ $ __ 11,995.0000
39 CHOCOLATE WHOLE - HALF GALLON 38.000 NO PRODUCT # | $ 1.9300 | $ _ 73,340.0000 | $ 1.0300 | $ _ 73,340.0000 | $ 1.9300 | $ ___ 73,340.0000 | $ 1.9300 | § __ 73,340.0000
40 1% MILK, CHOCOLATE — 1/2 PINT 2,000,000 NO PRODUCT # | $ 0.2150 | $___ 430,000.0000 | $ 0.2250 | $___ 450,000.0000 | $ 0.2399 | $ _ 479,800.0000 | $ 0.2499 [ $ __ 499,800.0000
a1 1 % MILK, CHOCOLATE - GALLON 80,000 NO PRODUCT #_| $ 3.5560 | $ _ 284,480.0000 | $ 3.5560 | $ _ 284,480.0000 | $ 3.5560 | $ _ 284,480.0000 | $ 3.5560 | $ _ 284,480.0000
a2 NON-DAIRY CREAMER — BOX (400 COUNT) 100 NO PRODUCT # | $ 10.5670 | $ 1,056.7000 | $ 10.7270 | $ 1,072.7000 | $ 10.5650 | $ 1,056.5000 | $ 10.7270 | $ 1,072.7000
| E 102.0414 | $_1,529,800.5560 | & 106.4934 | $_2,052,822.1810 | & 103.4868 | $_2,110,414.3735 | $ 105.3203 | 3 1,716,696.1770




MINIMUM ORDER PER DELIVERY (IF APPLICABLE)

BARBER'S/PRAIRIE FARMS/"EAST SIDE JERSEY DAIRY"

$150.00

PACA REGIONS TO SERVE|

ALL REGIONS COVERED

MAXIMUM COMPLETION OR DELIVERY TIME: _ DAYS FROM RECEIPT OF ORDER OOR NOTICE TO PROCEED

1

AMENDMENTS 1 THROUGH 7 YES

SIGNATURE PAGE YES

EXPERIENCE STATEMENT] YES

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT YES

EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY CERTIFICATION FORM YES

CERTIFICATION REGARDING DEBARMENT, SUSPENSION CONVICTIONS, PLEAS AND OTHER RESPONSIBLE MATTERS YES
NOTIFICATION OF INTENT TO RESPOND YES

AFFIDAVIT OF CONTRACTOR ALABAMA ACT 2011-535 YES

VENDOR CONTACT INFORMATION YES

PACA REQUIREMENTS YES

EXCEPTIONS

LINE ITEM 25: HALF-PINT; LINE ITEM 35: 4 OZ.

GUARANTEE POLICY|

NON-SUBMITTAL

CONTINGENCY PLAN

NON-SUBMITTAL




BID TABULATION

ERICKA ANDREW, BUYER

DEAN DAIRY FLUID LLC/ PURITY AND MAYFIELD DAIRIES - *“REGION 1 ONLY*
PRICE PER UNIT PRICE PER UNIT
PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDEDJLING CARTON| LLSADDLEN 12X PRICE PER UNIT | NO MILK COOLERS - PLASTIC MILK COOLERS -
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION ESTIMATE USAGE QTY | PRODUCT NUMBER (CARTON) LIEMIERICING mc‘wan 1‘211.1( Clel it (PLASTIC)) EXTENED PRICING mc{.unmc. 1v)11u< EXTENED PRICING
(CARTON) ST EXTENDED PRICING TERT
1 WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK - 1/2 PINT 200 51897 $ 0.2700 | $ 54.0000 | $ 0.2750 | $ 55.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK — PINT 5 51891 $ 0.9000 | $ 4.5000 | $ 0.9000 | $ 4.5000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK — QUART 5 51898 $ 2.0000 | $ 10.0000 | $ 2.0000 | $ 10.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK — 1/2 GALLON 1,000 51899 $ 2.2500 | $ 2,250.0000 | $ 2.2500 | $ 2,250.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 WHOLE HOMOGENIZED MILK — GALLON 2,000 51896 $ 3.9500 | $ 7,900.0000 | $ 3.9500 | $ 7,900.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 SKIM MILK — % PINT 300,000 52234 $ 0.2495 | $ 74,850.0000 | $ 0.2545 | $ 76,350.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 SKIM MILK, VANILLA — ¥ PINT 200,000 NO BID NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 WHOLE STRAWBERRY MILK, - 1 PINT 5 NO BID NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 SKIM MILK, STRAWBERRY - 1/2 PINT 400,000 46073 $ 0.2465 | $ 98,600.0000 | $ 0.2515| $  100,600.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 1 % LOW FAT MILK - 1/2 PINT 2,000,000 56995 $ 0.2485| $  497,000.0000 | $ 0.2535| $  507,000.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 1% LOW FAT MILK — QUART 5 NO BID NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 1% LOW FAT MILK - % GALLON 5 56965 $ 2.1500 | $ 10.7500 | $ 2.1500 | $ 10.7500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 1% LOW FAT MILK - GALLON 50 56860 $ 3.8500 | $ 192.5000 | $ 3.8500 | $ 192.5000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
14 2% LOW FAT MILK - QUART 5 NO BID NO BID $ - $ - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 2% LOW FAT MILK - % GALLON 200 51895 $ 2.2000 | $ 440.0000 | $ 2.2000 | $ 440.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 2% LOW FAT MILK — GALLON 50 51893 $ 3.9500 | $ 197.5000 | $ 3.9500 | $ 197.5000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 WHOLE BUTTERMILK - 1/2 GALLON 10,000 60273 $ 2.1900 | $ 21,900.0000 | $ 2.1900 | $ 21,900.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 SKIM - HALF GALLON 50 519101 $ 2.1000 | $ 105.0000 | $ 2.1000 | $ 105.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
19 SKIM - GALLON 5 51900 $ 3.8500 | $ 19.2500 | $ 3.8500 | $ 19.2500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 NON-FAT BUTTERMILK - 1/2 PINT 5 47823 $ 0.2700 | $ 1.3500 | $ 0.2750 | $ 1.3750 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
21 NON-FAT BUTTERMILK - QUART 5 47824 $ 2.1000 | $ 10.5000 | $ 2.1000 | $ 10.5000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
22 NON-FAT BUTTERMILK — 1/2 GALLON 5 60274 $ 2.0500 | $ 10.2500 | $ 2.0500 | $ 10.2500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 NON-FAT BUTTERMILK — GALLON 5 32779 $ 3.9500 | $ 19.7500 | $ 3.9500 | $ 19.7500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 LACTOSE (LACTAID) FREE MILK - % PINT 1,000 NO BID NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 LACTOSE FREE MILK — QUART 5 NO BID NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
26 SOUR CREAM - 16 OZ 1,750 32766 $ 1.9500 | $ 3,412.5000 | $ 1.9500 | $ 3,412.5000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
27 SOUR CREAM - 5 LB 7,000 27203 $ 7.5000 | $ 52,500.0000 | $ 7.5000 | $ 52,500.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
28 WHIPPING CREAM - % PINT 25 58707 $ 1.5500 | $ 38.7500 | $ 1.5500 | $ 38.7500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
29 WHIPPING CREAM - QTS 25 58713 $ 5.2500 | $ 131.2500 | $ 5.2500 | $ 131.2500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 HALF & HALF - QTS 100 57383 $ 2.4500 | $ 245.0000 | $ 2.4500 | $ 245.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
31 HALF & HALF (400 COUNT) 50 59520 $ 14.7500 | $ 737.5000 | $ 14.7500 | $ 737.5000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
32 COTTAGE CHEESE, REDUCED FAT - 24 OZ 50 32769 $ 2.7500 | $ 137.5000 | $ 2.7500 | $ 137.5000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 COTTAGE CHEESE, REDUCED FAT - 5 LB 900 18821 $ 7.4500 | $ 6,705.0000 | $ 7.4500 | $ 6,705.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
34 FRESH ORANGE JUICE, 4 OZ 350,000 34686 $ 0.1575| $ 55,125.0000 | $ 0.1600 | $ 56,000.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 FRESH ORANGE JUICE, 8 OZ 5 49891 $ 0.2700 | $ 1.3500 | $ 0.2750 | $ 1.3750 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 FRESH ORANGE JUICE, 16 OZ 5 56615 $ 0.8500 | $ 4.2500 | $ 0.8500 | $ 4.2500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
37 FRESH ORANGE JUICE, 64 OZ 5 56599 $ 2.2500 | $ 11.2500 | $ 2.2500 | $ 11.2500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
38 SKIM MILK, CHOCOLATE - 1/2 PINT 50,000 48118 $ 0.2465 | $ 12,325.0000 | $ 0.2525 | $ 12,625.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
39 CHOCOLATE WHOLE - HALF GALLON 38,000 32781 $ 2.4900 | $ 94,620.0000 | $ 2.4900 | $ 94,620.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
40 1% MILK, CHOCOLATE — 1/2 PINT 2,000,000 47282 $ 0.2501 | $  500,200.0000 | $ 0.2551 | $  510,200.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 1 % MILK, CHOCOLATE - GALLON 80,000 50525 $ 4.2500 | $  340,000.0000 | $ 4.2500 | $  340,000.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
42 NON-DAIRY CREAMER - BOX (400 COUNT) 100 32595 $ 10.6000 | $ 1,060.0000 | $ 10.5000 | $ 1,050.0000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GRAND TOTAL_ 3 T03.7886 | $ 1,770,820.7000 | $ T03.7321 | $_1,795,405.7500 | $ = ) - ) = T -




MINIMUM ORDER PER DELIVERY (IF APPLICABLE)

I DEAN DAIRY FLUID LLC/ PURITY AND MAYFIELD DAIRIES - *REGION 1 ONLY*

$150.00

PACA REGIONS TO SERVE|

ONLY REGION 1#

MAXIMUM COMPLETION OR DELIVERY TIME: _ DAYS FROM RECEIPT OF ORDER NOTICE TO PROCEED

3

AMENDMENTS 1 THROUGH 7

YES

SIGNATURE PAGE

YES

EXPERIENCE STATEMENT|

YES

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT

YES

EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY CERTIFICATION FORM

YES

CERTIFICATION REGARDING DEBARMENT, SUSPENSION CONVICTIONS, PLEAS AND OTHER RESPONSIBLE MATTERS

YES

NOTIFICATION OF INTENT TO RESPOND

YES

AFFIDAVIT OF CONTRACTOR ALABAMA ACT 2011-535

YES

VENDOR CONTACT INFORMATION

YES

PACA REQUIREMENTS

YES

EXCEPTIONS

ITEM 10: BID CALLS FOR REGULAR 1% LOWFAT UNFLAVORED MILK. OUR 1% PREMIUM MILK CONTAIN
ACIDOPHILUS; ITEM NUMBERS 20, 21, 22, AND 23: CALL FOR FAT FREE BUTTERMILK, OUR BUTTERMILK IS
MADE WITH 1% MILK. ITEM NUMBERS 32 AND 33: CALL FOR REDUCED FAT COTTAE CHEESE WHICH MEANS
2%, OUR COTTAGE CHEESE IS 1% LOWFAT. ****BIDDING ONLY REGION 1****

GUARANTEE POLICY

THE DEAN DAIRY FLUID MILK PLANTS AT MAYFIELD AND PURITY ARE LEVE 3 SQF CERTIFIED. MEANING WE
GO TO THE EXTREMES TO MAKE SURE OUR CUSTOMERS GET THE HIGHEST QUALITY DAIRY PRODUCTS THAT
THEIR MONEY CAN BUY. WE GUARANTEE IF OUR DAIRY PRODUCTS ARE STORED AND SERVED FROM
REFRIGERATION COOLERS AT A TEMPERATURE BELOW 40 DEGREES YOU WILL NOT HAVE ISSUES WITH
QUALITY OR TASTE.

CONTINGENCY PLAN

SCHOOLS WILL BE REQUIRED TO ORDER AND MAINTAIN ADEQUATE INVENTORY TO CARRY THEM THROUGH
BREAKFAST ON THEIR SCHEDULED DELIVERY DAY. IF A TRUCKS BREAKS DOWN ON A REGULAR
SHCEDULED DELIVERY DAY AND THE SCHOOL HAS ENOUGH MILK TO SERVE FOR BREAKFAST, IT GIVES OUR
LOGISTICS TEAM TIME TO MAKE DELIVERIES BEFORE LUNCH BEGINS. EACH BRANCH HAS SPARE TRUCKS,
SUPERVISORS AND BRANCH MANAGERS. THESE FOLKS ARE ON CALL 24 /7 IN CASE THERE IS A NEED FOR
AN EMERGENCY DELIVERY.




